
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT COST 

1 5/8" x 3/4" Water Meter w/ltron ILC 48 s 153. 79 

2 1" Water Meter w / ltron ILC 2 s 214.69 

3 1-1 /2" Water Meter w/ltron ILC 5 No Bid 

4 2" Water Meter w/ Itron ILC 10 No Bid 

5 Itron Water ERTs - 100 WP 24 No Bid 

6 Itron Water ERTs - 100 WE 24 No Bid 

TOTAL QUOTE 

Total Bid Comparison Including 5% NM State Preference 

Total Bid Comparison Including 10% (Maximum) Resident 

Veteran Preference 

Quote Results 
RDQ# 2017-593 

Water Meters and ERTs 
Due Date: October 3, 2016 9:00 AM 

Purchase Order Issued to : 

Ferguson Waterworks Mtn States Pipe & Supply 
TOTAL DELIVERY EST UNIT COST TOTAL DELIVERY EST 

s 7,381.92 6-8 Weeks $ 99.00 $ 4,752.00 1 Week ARO 

s 429.38 6-8 Weeks $ 227.00 $ 454.00 4WeekARO 

$ 348.00 $ 1,740.00 4WeekARO 

$ 462.00 $ 4,620.00 4WeekARO 

$ 74.60 $ 1,790.40 4WeekARO 

$ 74.60 $ 1,790.40 1 Week ARO 

s 7,811.30 $ 15, 146.80 

Will accept Mtn States Pipe ft Supply Quote 
in full on the bases of delivery for items 

Resource-Wise 
UNIT COST TOTAL DELIVERY EST 

s 95.20 s 4,569.60 4-6 Weeks 

s 201 .25 s 402.50 4-6 Weeks 

s 333.50 s 1,667.50 4-6 Weeks 

s 442.75 s 4,427.54 4-6 Weeks 

s 78.75 s 1,890.00 4-6 Weeks 

s 78.75 s 1,890.00 4-6 Weeks 

s 14,847.14 

Mountain States Pipe & Supply


