
Item Description Qty
Unit
Price Extended Price

Unit
Price Extended Price

1

Total Nitrogen (TN) 52             105.00                5,460.00                       -    no bid 

2

Benzidine 2             370.00                   740.00                       -    no bid 

3

MethylMercury 2             300.00                   600.00                       -    no bid 

4

Hexachlorabenzene 2
 included with 

#2 
 no charge                       -    no bid 

5

Total Phosphorus (TP) 52                40.00                  2,080.0                       -    no bid 

6

Total Suspended Solids (TSS) 156                35.00                5,460.00                       -    no bid 

7

Delta-BHC 4             215.00                   860.00                       -    no bid 

8

Cyanide Total Recoverable   4                55.00                   220.00                       -    no bid 

9

5-Day Biochemical Oxygen 
Demand (BOD5), Wastewater

104                65.00                6,760.00                       -    no bid 

10

Total Dissolved Solids (TDS) 28                35.00                      980.0                       -    no bid 

11

5 Haleoacitic Acids (HAA5) 8             200.00                1,600.00                       -    no bid 

12

Total Trihalomethanes (TTHM) 8             135.00                1,080.00                       -    no bid 

13

Sludge Waste Permit TCLP 
Testing

2          1,100.00                2,200.00                       -    no bid 

14

Additional Cost for Sample Pick 
Up and Shipping (if any).

52                       -                               -                         -    no bid 

15

Whole Effluent Toxicity Testing 4             900.00                  3,600.0          1,180.00          4,720.00 

16

Total Organic Carbon (TOC) 2                40.00                   320.00                       -    no bid 

17

Alkalinity 52                35.00                   140.00                       -    no bid 

18

Pollutant Scan 4          1,500.00                  1,500.0  no bid 

33,600.00$         4,720.00$     Total:

Eurofins Enviromnent Testing 
South Central, LLC

Eurofins Enviroment Bio-
Aquaics, TX

Lead Time: 5-15 DAYS (VARIED)  7-10 DAYS 

Quote Expiration Date: 07/30/25 07/30/25

Quote Tabulation
Date: 06/30/2025

RFQ 2025-874, LABORATORY TESTING 
SERVICES
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